Frederick Quinn Corporation

N

Bid Tally
Trade: BP#3-02 Selective Demolition
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3
FQC #508
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= g BIlg8|m E Existing Corridor Alternate #4
3 3 S |8l= @ S | Alternate #1 Stage | Floors, Base, Stair Alternate #3 Complete
2012 2|3 ; g3 Curtain & Track Finishes & Mastic Exhaust Fans Demolition Work
Subcontractor Base Bid als|éa ADD DEDUCT DEDUCT DEDUCT
e T e T
1 Break Thru Enterprises, Inc., Lombard $227,800.00 X x x | x| x| x| x $2,300.0d ($41,000.00) ($1,200.00) $0.00
LUSD, LLC, Chicago No Bid Security - Not Read
& Alpine Demolition Services, St. Charles $642,250.00 X X x | x| x| x| x $6,500.00 ($80,000.00) ($5,250.00) $7,688.00
4 Green Demolition Contractors, Chicago $438,800.00 X X x | x| x| x| x $4,000.00 ($115,000.00) ($1,100.00) $4,000.00




Frederick Quinn Corporation

Bid Tally
Trade: BP#3-06a Carpentry / General Trades
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3
FQC #508
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Subcontractor Base Bid < | < < |<|2|8|é&
1 R.B. Construction, Inc., Villa Park $245,000.00 X X x | x| x| x
2 Metropoliton Corporation, Dyer, IN $302,000.00 X X x | x| x| x| x
4 Hargrave Builders, Inc., South Elgin $234,450.00 X X x | x| x| x| x
4 R.L. Sohol General Contractors, Inc., Plainfield $378,000.00 X X x | x| x| x| x




Trade: BP#3-09a Ceramic Tiling
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3

Frederick Quinn Corporation

Bid Tally

FQC #508
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Subcontractor Base Bid <)< <2 o]o
TSI Commercial Floor Covering, Inc., Champaign $284,345.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x
2 Northern lllinois Terrazzo & Tile Co., Rockford $281,906.00 x| x| x| x| x| x
3 Regency Tile, Inc. Bartlett $326,810.00 x| x| x| x| x| x}|x
4 ) :
Lowery Tile Company, Alsip $488,000.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x




Frederick Quinn Corporation

Bid Tally
Trade: BP#3-09b Acoustical Ceilings & Treatments
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3

FQC #508
1.8.19
IS8 |F]|E
B =
d sl |s|2]|5]S
Subcontractor Base Bid <]<|<|<|2]18]35]
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1Hykotter, Inc., Montgomery $112,995.00 x| x| x| x| x X
2 Alpine Acoustics, Schaumburg $111,989.00
: International Decorators, Inc., Barrington $109,000.00
Pinto Construction Group, Palos Hills $179,146.00
> Just Rite Acoustics, Inc., Elk Grove Village $141,085.00
6 Metropoliton Corporation, Dyer, IN $186,100.00




=

Frederick Quinn Corporation

Bid Tally
Trade: BP#3-09¢ Resilient Flooring & Carpet
|Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3
FQC #508
1.8.19
i % % i = Alternate #2
E15|1515|a8)|E Alternate #1 Removal of existing
E g g E B | 2| S | Resilient Tile & Base | floors, base & stair
AERE R BT Work finish
> S
Subcontractor Base Bid S|<|<|1<|12]18]& DEDUCT ADD
Boss Carpet One, LLC, Dixon $543,120.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x| ($249,805.00) $100,450.00
TS| Commercial Floor Covering, Champaign $384,608.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x| ($209,220.00) $42,502.00
Vortex Commercial Flooring, Addison $374,290.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x ($144,666.00) $18,445.00




Trade: BP#3-09d Painting
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3

Frederick Quinn Corporation

Bid Tally

FQC #508
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Subcontractor Base Bid < __‘_‘__ < <8 :H KA
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May Decorating Il, Inc., Palatine No Bid Security Not Read
2 Midwest Decorating, Inc., Hampshire No Bid Security Not Read
3Nedrow Decorating, Inc., Aurora $49,350.00 x| x| x| x| x| x
a
Oosterbaan & Sons Co., Posen, IL $36,620.00 xl x| x| x| x| x| x
> GP Maintenance Setrvices, Inc., Palos Hills $68,000.00 x| x x| 4




Frederick Quinn Corporation

Bid Tally
Trade: BP#3-10 Folding Panel Partition
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3
FQC #508
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Subcontractor Base Bid <|<|<|<]|2|8|é&
4 Modernfold Chicago, Inc., Carol Stream $70,000.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x
2 Hufcor, Inc., Addison $63,675.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x




Frederick Quinn Corporation

Bid Tally
Trade: BP#3-21 Fire Protection Sprinklers
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3
FQC #508
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C.L. Doucette, Inc., Chicago $45,900.00

$35,400.00 x| x| x| x| x| x $5,000.00

4 USA Fire Protection, Inc., Lake Forest




Frederick Quinn Corporation

Bid Tally
Trade: BP#3-22 Plumbing
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3
FQC #508
1.8.19
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Subcontractor Base Bid || < <) olo |
1 DeFranco Plumbing, Inc., Palatine $448,849.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x
2Jensen's Plumbing & Heating, Inc., Woodstock $359,400.00 x| x| x| x| x| x
3A&HPIumbing&Heating Co., Inc., Elk Grove Village $343,800.00 xbP x| x| x| x| x| x
4
Mechanical Incorporated, Freeport $273,800.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x
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Trade: BP#3-23 HVAC
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3

Frederick Quinn Corporation

FQC #508
1.8.19
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E|IE| E|E 2 Alternate #1
2l2|2|2|&|~|E | Omittheremoval &
gle]ls|8|=2]2|L | replacementof new
131313 :; 213 exhaust fans
Subcontractor Base Bid e18|& DEDUCT
F.E. Moran, Inc., Downers Grove $345,000.00 x| x| x| x| x| x ($38,000.00)
2 Premier Mechanical, Inc., Addison $423,000.00 x§ x| x| x| x| x| x ($41,000.00)
Amber Mechanical Contractors, Inc., Alsip $329,000.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x No Bid
DeKalb Mechanical, Inc., DeKalb $336,000.00 x| x| x| x| x{ x| x ($48,000.00)
C. Acitelli Heating & Piping Contractors, Inc., Villa Park $378,000.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x ($49,000.00)
. Jensen's Plumbing & Heating, Inc., Woodstock $338,000.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x ($43,300.00)
Monaco Mechanical, Inc. $453,000.00 x| x| x|zl x| x| X ($65,000.00)




Frederick Quinn Corporation

Bid Tally
Trade: BP#3-26 Electrical & Low Voltage
Project: GESD #41 / Hadley Junior High BP #3
FQC #508
1.8.19
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o
TIZI 2 |8|m|__| E | disconnectandre- Alternate #2
S131313l=2|2] 8 | connectionof new Omit updated
sl3lz 2|21l = exhaust fans Sound/Theatrical Lighting
RIE| S
Subcontractor Base Bid el8lé& DEDUCT System DEDUCT
' ] T IS THOTO] It BRER
3 Excel Electric, Inc., Frankfort $519,000.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x ($3,200.00) ($55,925.00)
¢ Correct Electric, Inc., Newark $433,375.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x ($3,300.00) ($108,245.00)
£ Arc 1 Electric, Inc. $4,622,243.94 x x| x| x| x| x| x ($3,105.00) ($104,300.00)
% Lyons Electric Company, Inc., LaGrange $496,700.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x ($1,300.00) ($105,000.00)
? Hy-Power Electric Company, Inc. $567,000.00 x| x] x| x] x| x| x ($5,000.00) ($62,315.00)
" McWilliams Electric Co., Inc., Schaumburg $426,070.00 x| x| x| x| x| x| x ($3,640.00) ($125,890.00)
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